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Lucas Courity Engineer

ACCESS PERMIT

(PLEASE PRINT)

Access Permit No. 17-035 Address: 7839 SEAMANRD  33-15384

Effective Date: 1/23/2017

The permit under the conditions stated in the application or stated below (with the conditions stated below
superceding the application) is hereby:

GRANTED | DENIED L] GRANTED (TEMPORARY)

Justification for Denial (if applicable):

Conditions for approval if other than information or conditions outlines in the application (including
attachments):

PERMIT GRANTED FOR PROPOSED LOT SPLIT, AND CONSTRUCTION OF ONE DRIVE/ACCESS, LOCATED AT LEAST 200 FT FROM ADJACENT
EXISTING DRIVEWAY(S), ON PROPOSED NEW PARCEL, AS COORDINATED WITH AND APPROVED BY THE L.C.E. DRAINAGE DEPARTMENT.

CHECK whichever applies:
L]

This preliminary access approval will remain in valid for a period of two (2) years beyond the effective date unless
noted otherwise in the permit conditions.

L1 This access permit will remain valid for a period of one (1) year beyond the effective date unless noted
otherwise in the permit conditions.

Recommended By:

1/23/2017
Date
Inspected By:
A 4B Date
é"%“ 1/23/2017
Keith G. Earley, PE, PS, Lucas County Engineer Date
Permit Fee:  $50.00 (Check or Cash Only)
($50.00 which includes 1 hour of review time, plus $35.00 per Make check Payable to the "LUCAS COUNTY

hour for additional review time.) ENGINEER'S OFFICE".

FEE PAID: YES ]



Kyle Warner - Access Permit #17-035 correction

From:  Barb Wolf <barbwolf520@yahoo.com>

To: "KWarner@co.lucas.oh.us" <KWarner@co.lucas.oh.us>
Date: 1/31/2017 3:18 PM

Subject: Access Permit #17-035 correction

To: Kyle Warner, P.E.

Subject: Access Permit No. 17-035

From: Kenneth and Barbara Wolf
7740 Corduroy Road

Oregon, Ohio 43616
419-836-2402

Date: January 31, 2017

We mistakenly sent the wrong parcel number and address on the Access Permit application
form.

The correct Parcel Number is 33-15384

The correct Address is 7839 Seaman Road  Oregon, Ohio 43616

Thank you for reprocessing the permit with these corrections and we apologize for the
inconvenience.

Sincerely,
Kenneth and Barbara Wolf
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Lucas Courity Engineer

ACCESS PERMIT

(PLEASE PRINT)

Access Permit No. 17-035 Address: 57 SN RD  33gp324

Effective Date: 1/23/2017

The permit under the conditions stated in the applicatien or stated below (with the conditions stated below
superceding the application) is hereby:

GRANTED | DENIED ] GRANTED (TEMPORARY)

Justification for Denial (if applicable):

Conditions for approval if other than information or conditions outlines in the application (including
attachments):

PERMIT GRANTED FOR PROPOSED LOT SPLIT, AND CONSTRUCTION OF ONE DRIVE/ACCESS, LOCATED AT LEAST 200 FT FROM ADJACENT
EXISTING DRIVEWAY(S), ON PROPOSED NEW PARCEL, AS COORDINATED WITH AND APPROVED BY THE L.C.E. DRAINAGE DEPARTMENT.

CHECK whichever applies:
L]

This preliminary access approval will remain in valid for a period of two (2) years beyond the effective date unless
noted otherwise in the permit conditions.

L1 This access permit will remain valid for a period of one (1) year beyond the effective date unless noted
otherwise in the permit conditions.

Recommended By:

1/23/2017
Date
Inspected By:
A 4B Date
é"‘“g?“ 1/23/2017
Keith G. Earley, PE, PS, LucasiCounty Engineer Date
Permit Fee:  $50.00 (Check or Cash Only)
($50.00 which includes 1 hour of review time, plus $35.00 per Make check Payable to the "LUCAS COUNTY
hour for additional review time.) ENGINEER'S OFFICE".

FEE PAID: YES ]
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